
Chapter 40: Feyre’s Trial and Triumph

In Chapter 40, Feyre’s determination and the weight of her dire circumstances collide as she faces her second
trial under Amarantha’s cruel watch. With a haunting atmosphere in the cavernous room, Feyre finds herself
standing before an audience of faeries, including her cursed love, Tamlin, and the taunting Amarantha, who
relishes in her power over the captive girl. The gilded walls of the chamber offer a false sense of grandeur,
masking the darkness that looms as Feyre steels herself for the trial, determined to endure whatever
Amarantha throws her way, even as doubt threatens to overpower her. As the trial begins, Feyre’s eyes
briefly meet Tamlin’s, a shared moment of silent communication and understanding passing between them,
giving her a fleeting sense of hope amidst the cruel world around her. Yet, the looming threat of Amarantha’s
wrath hangs heavily in the air, making every step forward feel like a gamble with death.

Feyre’s task quickly reveals itself to be more treacherous than she anticipated: a seemingly impossible riddle,
accompanied by the weighty decision of pulling the right lever from three, with the fate of her friend Lucien
hanging in the balance. As the ground shifts beneath her feet and she is lowered into a dark pit, the terror of
the situation intensifies, with Lucien’s chained form appearing on the opposite side, helpless and vulnerable.
The riddle and the cruel setup leave Feyre with a sinking feeling, knowing that failure would result not only
in her own death but also the death of the innocent faerie beside her. Her fear of the task grows with each
passing second, and her lack of literacy only deepens the anxiety, leaving her paralyzed in doubt.

Despite the overwhelming odds, Feyre’s determination rises to the surface as she faces the challenge head-
on. She knows the gravity of her actions—her survival or death rests on a split-second decision, one that
could seal her fate. In the face of seemingly insurmountable pressure, Feyre makes her choice, trusting in her
instincts and hoping that luck will be on her side. When the chosen lever stops the spiked grate mere inches
above her head, a wave of relief crashes over her, though it’s tempered by the emotional toll the experience
has taken. She emerges victorious in the physical sense but feels deeply shaken by the ordeal, realizing how
much of her survival was due to mere chance rather than skill or intellect.

In the aftermath of her trial, Feyre struggles with her vulnerability, questioning whether her victories will be
enough to survive the looming third trial. She reflects on the emotional and psychological toll this journey
has had on her, confronting the darker side of herself—one shaped by pain, loss, and the constant shadow of
death. Rhysand’s presence offers some comfort, though it is complicated by the layers of resentment and
confusion she feels toward him. His aid provides a strange sense of solace, yet Feyre cannot ignore the
complex web of emotions that tie her to both him and Tamlin, who remains locked in his own silent struggle
to protect her.

Feyre’s journey through this chapter highlights her capacity for resilience, but it also emphasizes the heavy
cost of survival in the faerie world. Every choice she makes seems weighed down by sacrifice and moral
compromise, forcing her to grow into a woman shaped by the battles she faces. Yet, through all the blood,
sweat, and fear, Feyre’s spirit remains unbroken—her love for Tamlin and her drive to protect those she cares
about fueling her in the face of unspeakable odds. This trial, like the ones before it, reveals the complexity of
her inner strength, the blurred lines between right and wrong in her world, and the profound depth of the
relationships that anchor her in the storm. The stakes are only getting higher, and the journey she must
undertake is far from over.


